RYA21710 HJJ S.L.C. ﬂ» W

AMENDMENT NO. Calendar No.

Purpose: To improve provisions of the bill relating to natural
resources-related infrastructure, wildfire management,
and ecosystem restoration.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES—117th Cong., 1st Sess.

S.

To invest in the energy and outdoor infrastructure of the
United States to deploy new and innovative technologies,
update existing infrastructure to be reliable and resilient,
and secure energy infrastructure against physical and
cyber threats, and for other purposes.

Referred to the Committee on and
ordered to be printed

Ordered to lie on the table and to be printed
AMENDMENTS intended to be proposed by Mr. WYDEN gnd Ms,CM\'Lwd\
Viz:
1 In section 8003(a), strike “$3,369,200,000” and in-
2 sert “$9,882,000,000”.

3 In section 8003(c)(9), strike “$20,000,000” and in-
4 sert “$40,000,000”,

5 In section 8003(e)(9)(A), strike “$10,000,000” and
6 insert “$20,000,000”.



RYA21710 HJJ S.L.C.

10

11
12

13
14

15
16

2
In seetion 8003(c¢)(9)(B), strike “$10,000,000”” and

insert “$20,000,000”.

In section 8003(c)(11), strike “$500,000,000” and
insert “$1,500,000,000".

In section 8003(e)(11)(B)(i), strike “$100,000,000”
and insert “$300,000,000”.

In seetion 8003(¢)(11)(B)(ii), strike “$400,000,000”
and insert “$1,200,000,0007.

In section 8003(e)(12), strike “$500,000,000” and
insert “$1,500,000,000".

In section 8003(¢)(13), strike “$500,000,000” and
insert “$1,500,000,000”.

In section 8003(e)(13)(A), strike “$250,000,000”
and insert “$750,000,000".

In section 8003(¢)(13)(B), strike “$250,000,000”
and insert “$750,000,000".



RYA21710 IIJJ S.L.C

10

11
12

13

14
15

3
In section 8003(c¢)(14), strike “$500,000,000” and

insert “$1,500,000,000”.

In section 8003(¢)(14)(A), strike “$250,000,000”
and insert “$750,000,000".

In section 8003(c)(14)(B), strike “$250,000,000”
and insert “$750,000,000”".

In section 8003(e)(16), strike “$200,000,000” and
isert “$500,000,000”.

In section 8003(e)(16)(A), strike “$100,000,000”
and insert “$250,000,000”.

In section 8003(e)(16)(B), strike “$100,000,000”
and insert “$250,000,000”.

In section 8003(¢)(16)(B), strike “and”.

In seetion 8003(e)(17), strike “$8,000,000” and in-
sert “$20,000,000”.



RYA21710 HJJ S.L.C.

1

4
In seetion 8003(e)(17)(B), strike the period at the

2 end and nsert a semicolon.

O oo 3 O i B W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16

17
18

19

At the end of section 8003(c), add the following:

(18) $500,000,000 to be distributed under the
Cooperative Forestry Assistance Act of 1978 (16
U.S.C. 2101 et seq.) to build capacity for wildfire
prevention, mitigation, control, and suppression on
non-Federal land,;

(19) $1,500,000,000 for entering into contracts
with Indian Tribes under the Indian Self-Determina-
tion Act (25 U.S.C. 5321 et seq.) for the purpose
of implementing forestry projects that further Tribal
priorities; and

(20) $50,000,000 for wood innovation relating
to hazardous fuels under the Healthy Forests Res-
toration Act of 2003 (16 U.S.C. 6501 et seq.).

In section 8004(a), strike “$2,130,000,000” and in-

sert “$12,320,000,000".

In section 8004(b)(1), strike “$300,000,000”" and in-

20 sert “$1,000,000,000”.



RYA21710 ILJJ 8.L.C.

10

11
12

13
14

15
16

5
In section 8004(b)(1)(B)(i), strike “$50,000,000”

and insert “$200,000,000”.

In seetion 8004(b)(1)(B)(), strike “$150,000,000”
and insert “$700,000,000”.

In section 8004(b)(4), strike “$400,000,000” and in-
sert “$1,000,000,000".

In section 8004(b)(6), strike “$200,000,000" and in-
sert “$500,000,000”.

In section 8004(b)(6)(A), strike “$100,000,000” and
insert “$250,000,000”.

In section 8004(b)(6)(B), strike “$100,000,000” and
insert “$250,000,000".

In section 8004(b)(7), strike “$100,000,000” and in-
sert “$500,000,0007.

In section 8004 (b)(8), strike “$200,000,000” and in-
sert “$500,000,000”,



RYA21710 HJJ S.L.C.

1

6
In section 8004(b)(8)(A), strike “$100,000,000” and

2 insert “$250,000,000".

w

oo

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20

In seetion 8004 (b)(8)(B), strike “$100,000,000” and

insert “$250,000,0007".

In section 8004(b)(9)(B), strike “and”.

In section 8004(b)(10), strike the period at the end

and insert a semicolon.

At the end of section 8004(b), add the following:

(11) $40,000,000 for the Secretary of Agri-
culture to create a national community capacity for
land stewardship program to support collaborative
conservation efforts on public land;

(12) $200,000,000 for grants for the acquisi-
tion of community wood energy systems under the
Community Wood Energy and Wood Innovation
Program established under section 9013 of the
Farm Security and Rural Investment Act of 2003 (7
U.S.C. 8113);

(13) $100,000,000 for the State and private

forest landscape-scale restoration program estab-



RYA21710 HJJ S.L.C.

O 00 ~1 N Wi AW

N N N N N k=, = e e e e e
2 W N~ O 0O NN RN R, O

7
lished under section 13A of the Cooperative Forestry

Assistance Act of 1978 (16 U.S.C. 2109a);

(14) $500,000,000 for forest health protection
activities under section 8 of the Cooperative For-
estry Assistance Act of 1978 (16 U.S.C. 2104);

(15) $250,000,000 for activities under the Co-
operative Forestry Assistance Act of 1978 (16
U.S.C. 2101 et seq.) that focus on the working for-
est landscapes priority described in section 2(¢)(1) of
that Act (16 U.S.C. 2101(e)(1));

(16) $500,000,000 for the community forest
and open space conservation program established
under section 7A of the Cooperative Forestry Assist-
ance Act of 1978 (16 U.S.C. 2103d);

(17) $100,000,000 for urban and community
forestry assistance under section 9 of the Coopera-
tive Forestry Assistance Act of 1978 (16 U.S.C.
2105);

(18) $1,000,000,000 for vegetation and water-
shed management;

(19) $5,000,000,000 for capital improvements
and maintenance; and

(20) $200,000,000 for the Joint Chiefs pro-

gram.



RYA21710 ILJ.J S.L.C.

8
1 In section 8004(e)(1), strike “$45,000,000” and in-
2 sert “$225,000,000”,
3 In seetion 8004(e)(1), strike “$35,000,000” and in-

4 sert “$175,000,000".

5 In section 8004(e)(2)(A), strike “$20,000,000” and
6 insert “$100,000,000”.

7 In seetion 8004(e)(2)(B), strike “$5,000,000” and
8 insert “$25,000,000”,



